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Sri B. C. Uppin' M.Ai M.Ed.Principar Institutionar. Distinctiveness (2019-20)

Our JP College of Education has provided tremendous thrust and priority to its
Program of Diversity lnclusion and Integration - an area distinctive to the VLion of
the College. The Vision of the College is to educate, enable and empower young
women, including women students from different areas that form a significant
section of the student community in the College. The College emphasizes the need
to rnainstream the marginalized and weaker sections of students to ensure justice
and equity in society. Ihe Mission is to steer theeducation it offers not only towards
the pragmatic goal 'of employability, but also to build a life of the mind and sensitize
and orient its students to the service of the community. Under its Diversity lnclusion
and Integration Program, the College during Covid-19 pandemic in 2019-2020,
provided a vital support structure to conduct Online Teaching-Learning for our
students.The main purpose of the application is to make the online classes to the
students and make available of lectures to the students for their reference. As a part
of its Institutional Social Responsibility..The College is to bring all the teachers and
lectures to bring 'Under One Roof' Enabling Unit and Equal Opportunity Cell. Our
college provide pre-service training so our mission is to train well motivated teachers
who are intellectually competent, morally unright, socially and professionally
committed and spiritually inspired in order ti become instruments of social
transformation. lt admits 100 students every year for two year Bachelor of education
programme. This is a co-educational institution with permanent recognition from the
Government of Karnataka, NCTE . lt is permanently affiliated to Karnatak University
which is the biggest university in Karnataka.
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